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Drive totally enclosed within 
conveyor body.  No exposed moving 
parts, no projecting guards. Variable 
speed in both directions, adjustable 
from 10 to 30 or 30 t o60 FPM.

Convenient controls on recessed 
panel for safety and appearance.  
Start button, forward/reverse lever, 
speed adjusting knob, calibrated 
speed dial, reset button.  Panel 
swings out for access to panel 
wiring.  Panel interlock disconnects 
power for safety.
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Safety switch cord on both sides of 
conveyor for conenient stopping of 
conveyor from any work station along 
its length.

Heavy duty, smooth steel track 
keeps belt running true and ab-
sorbs side thrust from load/unload 
operations.  Top of track is 1/16" 
below top of belt.

5 Heavy duty conveyor body allows 
10' spacing between legs for un-
cluttered design. Legs are adjus-
table in height and are fitted with 
anchor pads.


